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April 27, 2018

Dear Fellow Stockholder:

You are cordially invited to attend the Annual Meeting of Stockholders of TripAdvisor, Inc. We will hold the Annual
Meeting on Thursday, June 21, 2018, at 11:00 a.m. local time at the Residence Inn located at 80 B Street, Needham,
MA 02494.

At the Annual Meeting, stockholders will be asked (1) to elect the eight directors named in this Proxy Statement,
(2) to ratify the appointment of KPMG LLP as our independent registered public accounting firm for the fiscal year
ending December 31, 2018, (3) to approve the TripAdvisor, Inc. 2018 Stock and Annual Incentive Plan; (4) to
approve, on an advisory basis, the compensation of our named executive officers; (5) to vote, on an advisory basis, on
the frequency of future advisory resolutions to approve the compensation of our named executive officers; and (6) to
consider and act upon any other business that may properly come before the meeting and any adjournments or
postponements thereof. The Board of Directors recommends a vote FOR proposals (1) through (4) and for every
“THREE” years on proposal (5).

You may vote if you were a stockholder of record on April 23, 2018. You may vote via the Internet or by telephone by
following the instructions on your Notice of Internet Availability and on the website noted in the Notice of Internet
Availability. In order to vote via the Internet or by telephone, you must have your stockholder identification number,
which is provided in your Notice. If you have requested a proxy card by mail, you may vote by signing, voting and
returning that proxy card in the envelope provided. If you attend the Annual Meeting, you may vote in person even if
you have previously returned your proxy card or have voted via the Internet or by telephone.

Your vote is very important to us. Please review the instructions for each voting option described in the Notice and in
this Proxy Statement. Your prompt cooperation will be greatly appreciated.

Sincerely,

STEPHEN KAUFER
President and Chief Executive Officer
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400 1st Avenue

Needham, Massachusetts 02494

NOTICE OF ANNUAL MEETING OF STOCKHOLDERS

To Be Held on June 21, 2018

The Annual Meeting of Stockholders of TripAdvisor, Inc., a Delaware corporation, will be held on Thursday, June 21,
2018, at 11:00 a.m. local time at the Residence Inn located at 80 B Street, Needham, MA 02494. At the Annual
Meeting, stockholders will be asked to consider the following:

1.To elect the eight directors named in this Proxy Statement, each to serve for a one-year term from the date of his
election and until such director’s successor is elected or until such director’s earlier resignation or removal;

2.To ratify the appointment of KPMG LLP as our independent registered public accounting firm for the fiscal year
ending December 31, 2018;

3.To approve the TripAdvisor, Inc. 2018 Stock and Annual Incentive Plan;

4.To approve, on an advisory basis, the compensation of our named executive officers;

5.To vote, on an advisory basis, on the frequency of future advisory resolutions to approve the compensation of our
named executive officers; and

6.To consider and act upon any other business that may properly come before the Annual Meeting and any
adjournments or postponements thereof.

Only holders of record of outstanding shares of TripAdvisor capital stock at the close of business on April 23, 2018
are entitled to notice of and to vote at the Annual Meeting and at any adjournments or postponements thereof.

In accordance with the rules of the U.S. Securities and Exchange Commission, we will furnish proxy materials over
the Internet.  We will send to our stockholders a Notice of Internet Availability of Proxy Materials on or about April
27, 2018, and provide access to our proxy materials over the Internet to our holders of record and beneficial owners of
our capital stock as of the close of business on the record date.  

Only stockholders and persons holding proxies from stockholders may attend the Annual Meeting. If your shares are
registered in your name, you must bring a form of identification to the Annual Meeting. If your shares are held in the
name of a broker, trust, bank or other nominee, you must bring a proxy or letter from that broker, trust, bank or other
nominee that confirms that you are the beneficial owner of those shares.

By Order of the Board of Directors,
SETH J. KALVERT
Senior Vice President, General Counsel
and Secretary

April 27, 2018

Important Notice Regarding the Availability of Proxy Materials
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for the Annual Meeting of Stockholders to Be Held on June 21, 2018

This Proxy Statement and the 2017 Annual Report are available at:

http://ir.tripadvisor.com/annual-proxy.cfm
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PROCEDURAL MATTERS

This Proxy Statement is being furnished to holders of common stock and Class B common stock of TripAdvisor, Inc.,
a Delaware corporation, in connection with the solicitation of proxies by TripAdvisor’s Board of Directors for use at its
2018 Annual Meeting of Stockholders or any adjournment or postponement thereof (the “Annual Meeting”). All
references to “TripAdvisor,” the “Company,” “we,” “our” or “us” in this Proxy Statement are to TripAdvisor, Inc. and its
subsidiaries.  An Annual Report to Stockholders, containing financial statements for the year ended December 31,
2017, and this Proxy Statement are being made available to all stockholders entitled to vote at the Annual Meeting.

TripAdvisor’s principal executive offices are currently located at 400 1st Avenue, Needham, Massachusetts 02494.
This Proxy Statement is being made available to TripAdvisor stockholders on or about April 27, 2018.

Date, Time and Place of Meeting

The Annual Meeting will be held on Thursday, June 21, 2018, at 11:00 a.m. local time at the Residence Inn located at
80 B Street, Needham, MA 02494.

Only stockholders and persons holding proxies from stockholders may attend the Annual Meeting. If your shares are
registered in your name, you must bring a form of identification to the Annual Meeting. If your shares are held in the
name of a broker, trust, bank or other nominee, otherwise known as holding in “street name,” you must bring a proxy or
letter from that broker, trust, bank or other nominee that confirms you are the beneficial owner of those shares.
Cameras and recording devices will not be permitted at the Annual Meeting.

Record Date and Voting Rights

The Board of Directors established the close of business on April 23, 2018 as the record date for determining the
holders of TripAdvisor common stock entitled to notice of and to vote at the Annual Meeting. On the record date,
125,819,936 shares of common stock and 12,799,999 shares of Class B common stock were outstanding and entitled
to vote at the Annual Meeting. TripAdvisor stockholders are entitled to one vote for each share of common stock and
ten votes for each share of Class B common stock held as of the record date, voting together as a single voting group,
on (i) the election of six of the eight director nominees, (ii) the ratification of the appointment of KPMG LLP as
TripAdvisor’s independent registered public accounting firm for the year ending December 31, 2018, (iii) the approval
of the TripAdvisor, Inc. 2018 Stock and Annual Incentive Plan; (iv) the approval, on an advisory basis, of the
compensation of our named executive officers; and (v) the vote, on an advisory basis, on the frequency of future
advisory resolutions to approve the compensation of our named executive officers.  TripAdvisor stockholders are
entitled to one vote for each share of common stock held as of the record date in the election of the two director
nominees that the holders of TripAdvisor common stock are entitled to elect as a separate class pursuant to
TripAdvisor’s restated certificate of incorporation.

On August 27, 2014, the entire beneficial ownership of our common stock and Class B common stock previously held
by Liberty Interactive Corporation, which is currently known as Qurate Retail, Inc. (“Liberty”) was transferred to
Liberty TripAdvisor Holdings, Inc. (“LTRIP”).  Simultaneously, Liberty, LTRIP’s former parent company, distributed,
by means of a dividend, to the holders of its Liberty Ventures common stock, Liberty’s entire equity interest in
LTRIP.  We refer to this transaction as the Liberty Spin-Off.  As a result of the Liberty Spin-Off, effective August 27,
2014, LTRIP became a separate, publicly traded company and 100% of Liberty’s interest in TripAdvisor was held by
LTRIP.  Liberty also assigned to LTRIP its rights and obligations under the Governance Agreement between
TripAdvisor and Liberty, dated December 20, 2011 (the “Governance Agreement”).
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As a result of these transactions, as of the record date, LTRIP beneficially owned 18,159,752 shares of our common
stock and 12,799,999 shares of our Class B common stock, which shares constitute 14.4% of the outstanding shares of
common stock and 100% of the outstanding shares of Class B Common Stock. Assuming the conversion of all of the
LTRIP’s shares of Class B common stock into common stock, as of the record date LTRIP would beneficially own
22.3% of the outstanding common stock. Because each share of Class B common stock generally is entitled to ten
votes per share and each share of common stock is entitled to one vote per share, as of the record date LTRIP may be
deemed to beneficially own equity securities representing 57.6% of our voting power. As a result, regardless of the
vote of any other TripAdvisor stockholder, LTRIP has control over the vote relating to (i) the election of six of the
eight director nominees; (ii) the ratification of the appointment of KPMG LLP as TripAdvisor’s independent registered
public accounting firm for the fiscal year ending December 31, 2018; (iii) the approval of the TripAdvisor, Inc. 2018
Stock and Annual Incentive Plan; (iv) the approval, on an advisory basis, of the compensation of our named executive
officers; and (v) the vote, on an advisory basis, on the frequency of future advisory resolutions to approve the
compensation of our named executive officers.  

Quorum; Abstentions; Broker Non-Votes

Transaction of business at the Annual Meeting may occur if a quorum is present. If a quorum is not present, it is
expected that the Annual Meeting will be adjourned or postponed in order to permit additional time for soliciting and
obtaining additional proxies or votes, and, at any subsequent reconvening of the Annual Meeting, all proxies will be
voted in the same manner as such proxies would have been voted at the original convening of the Annual Meeting,
except for any proxies that have been effectively revoked or withdrawn.

With respect to (i) the election of six of the eight director nominees; (ii) the ratification of the appointment of KPMG
LLP as TripAdvisor’s independent registered public accounting firm for the fiscal year ending December 31, 2018; (iii)
the approval of the TripAdvisor, Inc. 2018 Stock and Annual Incentive Plan; (iv) the approval, on an advisory basis,
on the compensation of our named executive officers; and (v) the vote, on an advisory basis, on the frequency of
future advisory resolutions to approve the compensation of our named executive officers, the presence at the Annual
Meeting, in person or by proxy, of the holders of a majority of the total votes entitled to be cast constitutes a quorum.
For the election of the two directors whom the holders of TripAdvisor common stock are entitled to elect as a separate
class, the presence at the Annual Meeting, in person or by proxy, of the holders of a majority of shares of common
stock constitutes a quorum.

If a share is represented for any purpose at the meeting, it is deemed to be present for quorum purposes and for all
other matters as well. Shares of TripAdvisor capital stock represented by a properly executed proxy will be treated as
present at the Annual Meeting for purposes of determining a quorum, without regard to whether the proxy is marked
as casting a vote or abstaining.

Abstentions and broker non-votes are counted as present and entitled to vote for purposes of determining a quorum. A
broker non-vote occurs when a nominee holding shares for a beneficial owner does not vote the shares on a proposal
because the nominee does not have discretionary voting power for a particular item and has not received instructions
from the beneficial owner regarding voting. Brokers who hold shares for the accounts of their clients have
discretionary authority to vote shares if specific instructions are not given with respect to the ratification of the
appointment of our independent registered public accounting firm. Brokers do not have discretionary authority to vote
on the election of our directors, so we encourage you to provide instructions to your broker regarding the voting of
your shares.

Solicitation of Proxies

TripAdvisor will bear the cost of the solicitation of proxies from its stockholders. In addition to solicitation by mail,
the directors, officers and employees of TripAdvisor, without additional compensation, may solicit proxies from
stockholders by telephone, by letter, by facsimile, in person or otherwise.
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Following the original mailing of the proxies and other soliciting materials, TripAdvisor will ask brokers, trusts, banks
or other nominees to forward copies of the proxy and other soliciting materials to persons for whom they hold shares
of TripAdvisor capital stock and to request authority for the exercise of proxies. In such cases, TripAdvisor, upon the
request of the brokers, trusts, banks and other stockholder nominees, will reimburse such holders for their reasonable
expenses.

Voting of Proxies

The manner in which your shares may be voted depends on whether you are a:

•Registered stockholder:    Your shares are represented by certificates or book entries in your name on the records of
TripAdvisor’s stock transfer agent and you have the right to vote those shares directly; or
•Beneficial stockholder:    You hold your shares “in street name” through a broker, trust, bank or other nominee and you
have the right to direct your broker, trust, bank or other nominee on how to vote the shares in your account; however,
you must request and receive a valid proxy from your broker, trust, bank or other nominee.
Whether you hold shares directly as a registered stockholder or beneficially as a beneficial stockholder, you may
direct how your shares are voted without attending the Annual Meeting. For directions on how to vote, please refer to
the instructions below and those on the Notice of Internet Availability of Proxy Materials, proxy card or voting
instruction form provided. To vote using the Internet or by telephone, you will be required to enter the control number
included on your Notice of Internet Availability of Proxy Materials or other voting instruction form provided by your
broker, trust, bank or other nominee.

•Using the Internet.    Registered stockholders may vote using the Internet by going to www.proxyvote.com and
following the instructions. Beneficial stockholders may vote by accessing the website specified on the voting
instruction forms provided by their brokers, trusts, banks or other nominees.
•By Telephone.    Registered stockholders may vote, from within the United States, using any touch-tone telephone by
calling 1-800-690-6903 and following the recorded instructions. Beneficial owners may vote, from within the United
States, using any touch-tone telephone by calling the number specified on the voting instruction forms provided by
their brokers, trusts, banks or other nominees.
•By Mail.    Registered stockholders may submit proxies by mail by requesting printed proxy cards and marking,
signing and dating the printed proxy cards and mailing them in the accompanying pre-addressed envelopes.
Beneficial owners may vote by marking, signing and dating the voting instruction forms provided by their brokers,
trusts, banks or other nominees and mailing them in the accompanying pre-addressed envelopes.
All proxies properly submitted and not revoked will be voted at the Annual Meeting in accordance with the
instructions indicated thereon. If no instructions are provided, such proxies will be voted FOR proposals (1), (2), (3)
and (4) and for every “THREE YEARS” on proposal (5).

TripAdvisor is incorporated under Delaware law, which specifically permits electronically transmitted proxies,
provided that each such proxy contains, or is submitted with, information from which the inspector of elections can
determine that such proxy was authorized by the stockholder. The electronic voting procedures provided for the
Annual Meeting are designed to authenticate each stockholder by use of a control number, to allow stockholders to
vote their shares and to confirm that their instructions have been properly recorded.
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Voting in Person at the Annual Meeting

You may also vote in person at the Annual Meeting. Votes in person will replace any previous votes you have made
by mail or telephone or via the Internet. We will provide a ballot to registered stockholders who request one at the
meeting. Shares held in your name as the stockholder of record may be voted on that ballot. Shares held beneficially
in street name may be voted on a ballot only if you bring a legal proxy from the broker, trust, bank or other nominee
that holds your shares giving you the right to vote the shares. Attendance at the Annual Meeting without voting or
revoking a previous proxy in accordance with the voting procedures will not in and of itself revoke a proxy.

Your vote is very important. Whether or not you plan to attend the Annual Meeting, please take the time to vote via
the Internet, by telephone or by returning your marked, signed and dated proxy card so that your shares will be
represented at the Annual Meeting.

Revocation of Proxies

Any proxy given pursuant to this solicitation may be revoked by the person giving it any time before the taking of the
vote at the Annual Meeting.

If you are a beneficial stockholder, you may revoke your proxy or change your vote only by following the separate
instructions provided by your broker, trust, bank or other nominee.

If you are a registered stockholder, you may revoke your proxy at any time before it is exercised at the Annual
Meeting by (i) delivering written notice, bearing a date later than the proxy, stating that the proxy is revoked,
(ii) submitting a later-dated proxy relating to the same shares by mail or telephone or via the Internet prior to the vote
at the Annual Meeting or (iii) attending the Annual Meeting and properly giving notice of revocation to the inspector
of elections or voting in person. Registered holders may send any written notice or request for a new proxy card to
TripAdvisor, Inc., c/o Broadridge, 51 Mercedes Way, Edgewood, New York 11717, or follow the instructions
provided on the Notice of Internet Availability of Proxy Materials and proxy card to submit a new proxy by telephone
or via the Internet. Registered holders may also request a new proxy card by calling 1-800-579-1639.

Other Business

The Board of Directors does not presently intend to bring any business before the Annual Meeting other than the
proposals discussed in this Proxy Statement and specified in the Notice of Annual Meeting of Stockholders. The
Board has no knowledge of any other matters to be presented at the Annual Meeting other than those described in this
Proxy Statement. If any other matters should properly come before the Annual Meeting, the persons designated in the
proxy will vote on them according to their best judgment.
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PROPOSAL 1:

ELECTION OF DIRECTORS

Overview

Our Board of Directors currently consists of nine members. Pursuant to the terms of TripAdvisor’s bylaws, each
director serves for a one-year term from the date of his or her election and until such director’s successor is elected or
until such director’s earlier resignation or removal.  The Board recommends that each of the eight nominees listed
below be elected to serve a one-year term and until such director’s successor shall have been duly elected and qualified
or until such director’s earlier resignation or removal:

Gregory B. Maffei

Stephen Kaufer

Jay C. Hoag

Dipchand (Deep) Nishar

Jeremy Philips

Spencer M. Rascoff

Albert E. Rosenthaler

Robert S. Wiesenthal

TripAdvisor’s restated certificate of incorporation provides that the holders of TripAdvisor common stock, acting as a
single class, are entitled to elect a number of directors equal to 25% of the total number of directors, rounded up to the
next whole number, which will be two directors as of the date of the Annual Meeting. The Board has designated
Messrs. Philips and Wiesenthal as nominees for the positions on the Board to be elected by the holders of TripAdvisor
common stock voting as a separate class.

Pursuant to the Governance Agreement, LTRIP has the right to nominate up to a number of directors equal to 20% of
the total number of the directors on the Board of Directors (rounded up to the next whole number if the number of
directors on the Board is not an even multiple of five) for election to the Board of Directors and has certain other
rights regarding committee participation, so long as certain stock ownership requirements applicable to LTRIP are
satisfied.  LTRIP has designated Messrs. Maffei and Rosenthaler as its nominees to the Board of Directors.

Although management does not anticipate that any of the nominees named above will be unable or unwilling to stand
for election, in the event of such an occurrence, proxies may be voted for a substitute nominee designated by the
Board of Directors.

Information Regarding Director Nominees

The information provided below about each nominee is as of the date of this Proxy Statement. The information
presented includes the names of each of the nominees, along with his age, any positions held with the Company, term
of office as a director, principal occupations or employment for the past five years or more, involvement in certain
legal proceedings, if applicable, and the names of all other publicly-held companies for which he or she currently
serves as a director or has served as a director during the past five years. The information also includes a description
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of the specific experience, qualifications, attributes and skills of each nominee that led our Board of Directors to
conclude that he should serve as a director of the company for the ensuing term.
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Gregory B. Maffei

Age: 57

Director Sin
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